
WE LOVE YOU,
 DEAR ANIMALS!



About penguins

• Penguins are marine birds but they can’t 
fly. They live on islands in sub-antarctic 
waters. Penguins usually get together in 
large colonies. All penguins are excellent 
swimmers and divers. They spend many 
days in the open sea to search for food. 
They eat fish. They are not afraid of snow 
and often rest on icy places.



• The little blue penguin is about 35 cm in 
the height and about 1 kg in weight and 
the amber penguin is to 115 cm and 25 to 
40 kg. Most penguins are black on the 
back and white below.



Video about penguins       Click



About tigers

• Tigers live in Asia. They are strong and 
clever. They sleep during the day and hunt 
at night. Tigers eat small and big animals. 
They are good hunters. A big tiger can eat 
50 kg meat  in one night. Tigers normally 
have two or four babies. They are called 
cubs. Cubs live with their mother until they 
are three years old.





About monkeys

• The chimpanzee
• They say it is the most intelligent animal. 

Dr. Blair from the New-York Zoological 
Park watched  Ellen, his female 
chimpanzee to put on a sweater. She 
could sit at the table, eat food with a fork 
like any other eight-year-old.



What do you know about monkeys?

Video about monkeys                                      Click



Make up your own story about 
animals 









Презентация подготовлена  
автором-составителем 

Татаровой С. Ф.
• для учащихся среднего звена 

общеобразовательных школ, 
обучающихся по  учебникам  
английского языка с грифом 
«Рекомендовано Минобраз»

•  для тех, кому интересна тема 
«Animals»

  



Источники

 I. UA, 2011 
 Клементьева Т. Б. Книга для чтения к 

учебному пособию  Счастливый 
английский – 2, Титул,1996


