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Music
They listen to music, 
which is full of sounds 
of cello, violin, viola and 
piano; also they listen 
to electric guitar 
accompaniment for the 
pure vocal.



The new 
subculture is                                        

«pure»
Style
"Pure" is the union of 
people who wears white 
clothes, because they 
believe that white is the 
color of purity, freedom 
and peace.

They do not have a bright 
make-up, they always look 
naturally and neatly.

They have a classic style 
in everything.

Object of their life is to 
follow the dream.

They are very 
independent, and they are 
philosophers.



Their religion: One 
God

They believe that all 
religions are branches of 
the original belief in one 
God

Their slogan: “Have pure 
soul and you will never get 
problems“

They study all aspects of 
art on one's Jack, they do 
not go to schools

They want to realize 
themselves, they strive 
for perfection, which does 
not exist.



Freedom

These people pay special 
attention to freedom.

They prefer loneliness so 
long until they haven't had 
something new, 
something great for 
themselves until they 
reach at least one of their 
"great" goals

They constantly travel 
around the world in the 
search of the place where 
they will feel themselves 
really free.


